
 THE INDIAN MEDICAL COUNCIL (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2013
A

BILL

further to amend the Indian Medical Council Act, 1956.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-fourth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Act,
2013.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 15th day of May, 2013.

 2. In the Indian Medical Council Act, 1956 (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act), for the long title, the following long title shall be substituted, namely:—

“An Act to provide for the constitution of the Medical Council of India
and for the determination, co-ordination, maintenance and regulation of
standards of medical education, the practice of medicine, maintenance of Indian
Medical Register and to make endeavour in making available doctors in all
States and for matters connected therewith or incidental thereto.”.

3.  In section 3 of the principal Act,—

 (a) in sub-section (1),—

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
long title.

Amendment of
section 3.

AS INTRODUCED IN THE RAJYA SABHA

Bill No. LII of 2013

102 of 1956.

5

10



2

 (i) after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

 “(aa) one member, to represent the Union territories by
rotation, to be nominated by the Central Government;”;

 (ii) in clause (b), the following provisos shall be inserted, namely:

 “Provided that where there is a Health University in a State,
that University shall elect one representative for every ten medical
colleges affiliated to it to represent such medical colleges:

 Provided further that a Health University with less than ten
medical colleges affiliated to it, shall also be eligible to elect one
representative to represent such medical colleges:

 Provided also that such number of representatives shall be
reviewed by the Central Government after every four years;”;

 (iii) clause (d) shall be omitted;

 (b) in sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:

 “Provided that no person shall hold office as the President or, as
the case may be, the Vice-President for more than two terms.”.

 4.  After section 3A of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“3AA. The Central Government shall, after the commencement of the
Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Act, 2013, reconstitute the Council, by
notification in the Official Gazette, and publish the names of the members
nominated or elected to the Council under sub-section (1) of section 3 within a
period not exceeding one hundred and eighty days:

 Provided that the Board of Governors constituted under sub-section (4)
of section 3A shall continue to exercise the powers and perform the functions
of the Council till the new Council is reconstituted or for such period not
exceeding one hundred and eighty days, whichever is earlier.”.

5. In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—

 (a) the words, brackets and letter “or clause (d)” shall be omitted;

 (b) the words, brackets, letter and figures “and any rules so made may
provide that pending the preparation of the Indian Medical Register in
accordance with the provisions of this Act, the members referred to in
clause (d) of sub-section (1) of section 3 may be nominated by the Central
Government instead of being elected as provided therein” shall be omitted.

6. In section 7 of the principal Act,—

 (a) in sub-section (1), for the words “five years”, the words “four years”
shall be substituted;

 (b) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(2) Subject to the provisions of the Act, a member, whether
nominated or elected, shall hold office for a term of four years.”;

 (c) in sub-section (6), for the words “five years”, the words “four years”
shall be substituted.

7. After section 9 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

 “9A. (1) The Council shall, subject to the provisions of the Act and rules
made thereunder, take measures to determine, coordinate and maintain the

Insertion of new
section 3AA.

Reconstitution of
Council.

Amendment of
section 4.

Amendment of
section 7.

Insertion of new
section 9A.

Functions of
Council.

5

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45



3

standards of medical education and practice in medicine, the Indian Medical
Register and make endeavour in making available doctors in all States.

 (2) Without prejudice to the generality of the foregoing provisions, the
measures referred to in sub-section (1), may, inter alia, provide for all or any of
the following matters, namely:—

 (a) lay down the standards of professional ethics in the practice of
medicine;

 (b) grant or withdraw permission for establishment of medical college
and course of study in medical education and ensure compliance of its
terms and conditions for such permission;

 (c) maintain the Indian Medical Register;

 (d) render advice to the Central Government or the State Government
on matters relating to the medical education and practice in medicine;

 (e) facilitate medical education in the institutions situated outside
the country;

 (f) undertake and recommend to the Central Government or the
State Government such measures as may be necessary to regulate medical
education in or outside the country;

(g) organise seminars, symposiums and workshops in order to
promote continuous medical education and practice in medicine; and

(h) perform such other functions as may be laid down in the rules
made by the Central Government.”.

8. In section 13 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-sections (2) and (3), for the words “a citizen of India”, the
words “a citizen of India or an overseas citizen of India” shall respectively be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4A), for the words “a citizen of India”, the words “a
citizen of India or an overseas citizen of India” shall be substituted;

(c) sub-section (4B) and the proviso relating thereto shall be omitted;

(d) in sub-section (4C), for the words, brackets, figures and letters “sub-
sections (4A) and (4B)”, the word, brackets, figure and letter “sub-section
(4A)” shall be substituted;

(e) after sub-section (5), the following Explanation shall be inserted,
namely:—

'Explanation.—For the purposes of this section, the expression
“overseas citizen of India” shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause
(ee) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Citizenship Act, 1955.'.

 9. In section 14 of the principal Act, in the proviso to sub-section (1), in
clause (b), the words “for the time being for the purposes of teaching, research or
charitable work” shall be omitted.

10. In section 21 of the principal Act,—

 (a) in sub-section (1), for the words “the names”, the words “the names
and biometric details” shall be substituted;

 (b) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

Amendment of
section 13.

Amendment of
section 14.

57 of 1955.

Amendment of
section 21.

5

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45



4

 '(2A) The Council shall, in addition to the Indian Medical Register
referred to in sub-section (1), maintain the Medical Register in electronic
form containing the particulars included in the Indian Medical Register.

 Explanation.— For the purpose of this sub-section, the expression,
“electronic form” shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (r) of
sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Information Technology Act, 2000.'.

11.  After section 30 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

 “30A. (1) The President, Vice-President or any member of the Council
may, by notice in writing under his hand addressed to the Central Government,
resign from his office:

 Provided that the President, Vice-President or any member of the Council
shall, unless he is permitted by the Central Government to relinquish his office
sooner, continue to hold office until the expiry of a period of three months from
the date of receipt of such notice or until a person duly appointed as his
successor enters upon his office or until the expiry of his term of office, whichever
is the earliest.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), the Central
Government may remove from office the President, Vice -President, or any member
of the Council, who—

(a) has been adjudged as an insolvent; or

(b) has become physically or mentally incapable of acting as such
President, Vice-President, or other member; or

(c) is of unsound mind and stands so declared by a competent
court; or

(d) has been convicted of an offence involving moral turpitude; or

(e) has acquired such financial or any other interest in any medical
institution falling within the purview of the Council, which is likely to
affect prejudicially the exercise of his functions as the President, Vice-
President, or a member; or

(f) is unable to perform or has made persistent defaults—

(i) in the performance of the duties imposed on him under
this Act or has exceeded or abused his position; or

(ii) either wilfully or without sufficient cause neglects to
comply with the directions issued by the Central Government under
sections 33A and 33B;

(g) has been guilty of proved misbehaviour or his continuance in
office would be detrimental in public interest.

(3) No person shall be removed from his office on the grounds specified
in clause (e) or clause (f) or clause (g) of sub-section (2), unless he has been
given a reasonable opportunity of being heard in the matter.”.

12. In section 32 of the principal Act, for sub-section (2), the following sub-
section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2) In particular, and without prejudice to the foregoing power, such
rules may provide for all or any of the following matters, namely:—

(a) the manner of election of the Council under sub-section (1) of
section 4;

Insertion of new
section 30A.

21 of 2000.

Amendment of
section 32.

Resignation,
removal and
suspension of
President,
Vice-President
or members of
Council.

5

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45



5

 (b) such other functions of the Council under clause (h) of sub-
section (2) of section 9A as may be laid down by the Central Government;

 (c) the conditions and payment of fees for filing of an appeal before
the Central Government under sub-section (2) of section 24;

(d) any other matter which is required to be, or may be, provided by
rules or in respect of which provision is to be made by rules.”.

13. In section 33 of the principal Act, for clause (ma), the following clause shall
be substituted, namely:—

 “(ma) the modalities for conducting screening test under
sub-section (4A) of section 13;”.

14.  After section 33 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be inserted,
namely:—

“33A. (1) Without prejudice to the foregoing provisions of this Act, the
Council shall, in the discharge of its functions and duties under this Act, be
bound by such directions on questions of policy as the Central Government
may give in writing to it from time to time.

(2) The decision of the Central Government whether a question is one of
policy or not shall be final.

 33B. (1) Where the Central Government considers it expedient so to do,
it may, by order in writing, direct the Council to make any regulations or to
amend or revoke any regulations already made by it, within such period as the
Central Government may specify in this behalf.

 (2) If the Council fails or neglects to comply with such order within the
specified period, the Central Government may make the regulations or amend or
revoke the regulations made by the Council, as the case may be, in such manner
as the Central Government thinks fit.

33C. Every rule and every regulation made under this Act shall be laid, as
soon as may be after it is made, before each House of Parliament, while it is in
session, for a total period of thirty days which may be comprised in one session
or in two or more successive sessions, and if, before the expiry of the session
immediately following the session or the successive sessions aforesaid, both
Houses agree in making any modification in the rule, regulation or both Houses
agree that the rule and regulation should not be made, the rule and regulation
shall, thereafter have effect only in such modified form or be of no effect, as the
case may be; so, however, that any such modification or annulment shall be
without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done under that rule or
regulation.”.

15. (1) The Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Ordinance, 2013 is hereby
repealed.

 (2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the
principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done
or taken under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this
Act.

Amendment of
section 33.

Insertion of new
sections 33A,
33B and 33C.

Power of
Central
Government to
give directions.

Powers of
Central
Government to
direct
regulations to be
made or to make
or amend
regulations.

Laying of rules
and regulations.

Repeal and
saving.

 Ord. 4 of 2013.

5

10

15

20

25

30

35

40



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Indian Medical Council Act, 1956 was enacted for the purpose of
reconstituting the Medical Council of India (the Council) and to provide for the
maintenance of the Indian Medical Register and for matters connected therewith.
The Act was amended, inter alia, by the Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Act,
2010 superseding the Council for one year with effect from the 15th May, 2010 and
providing for the constitution of a Board of Governors of not more than seven persons
to exercise the powers and to perform the functions of the Council under the said Act.
Subsequently, the term of the Board of Governors was extended to one year at a time
by amending the Act in 2011 and 2012 and as per the provisions of the Indian Medical
Council (Amendment) Act, 2012 the Council has to be reconstituted within a period of
three years from the date of its supersession, that is latest by the 14th May, 2013.

2. The Indian Medical Council Act, 1956 was amended by the Indian Medical
Council (Amendment) Ordinance, 2013 to provide for the reconstitution of  the Council
and review the composition of the said Council so as to give representation to the
Union territories and to remove the anomaly where States having larger number of
medical colleges, but having formed a medical university, were having fewer seats in
the Council as compared to States having fewer colleges affiliated to several
Universities, by inserting a proviso in clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 3.

3. The Council's main function as contained in the Indian Medical Council Act,
1956 is to make recommendations to the Central Government on matters relating to
recognition of medical qualifications, determining the courses of study and
examinations required to obtain such qualifications, inspection of examinations and
maintenance of register of medical practitioners, etc. By the amendment of the said
Act in 1993, the power to grant permission for establishment of new Medical Colleges,
increase in admission capacity or for starting new or higher course of study or training
in the established colleges was entrusted to the Central Government from the
respective State Governments.  For this purpose, the Council became a
recommendatory body to the Central Government for taking final decisions in these
matters.  After reviewing the working of the Council in this area and the problems
being faced, a need has been felt to empower the Central Government to give such
directions to the Council wherever necessary on matters of policy and public
importance and to ensure their proper compliance.

 4. As Parliament was not in session and immediate action was required to be
taken to extend the term of the Board of Governors of Medical Council of India
beyond the 14th May, 2013 and to allow the Board to exercise powers till the Council
is reconstituted and make necessary amendments to the Indian Medical Council Act,
1956, the Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Ordinance, 2013 was promulgated on
21st May, 2013.

5. The Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Bill, 2013, which seeks to replace
the Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Ordinance, 2013, inter alia, provides for
the following, namely:—

(a) to amend long title of the Indian Medical Council Act, 1956 (Act) so as
to make it more comprehensive;

(b) to amend sub-section (2) of section 3 of the Act so as to provide that
no person shall hold the post of President or Vice-President for more than two
terms;

(c)  to amend section 13 of the Act relating to recognition of medical
qualification and provisional registration so as to recognise the medical

6



7

qualifications granted to the citizen of India by medical institutions in India and
to extend the benefit to the overseas citizens of India;

(d)  to amend section 14 of the Act which recognises the medical practice
by the persons having medical qualifications granted by medical institutions in
any country outside India;

(e)  to insert a new section 30A in the Act relating to resignation by the
President, Vice-President and Members of the Council and the power of the
Central Government to remove from the office the President, Vice-President or a
Member; and

(f)  to insert a new section 33A in the Act relating to power of the Central
Government to give directions to the Council  on the matters of policy and for
making any regulation.

6. The proposed amendments will make the composition of the Council compact,
more representative in character, and empower the Central Government to discharge
its functions effectively to ensure proper development of medical education in the
country.

7. The Bill seeks to replace the aforesaid Ordinance.

NEW DELHI; GHULAM  NABI  AZAD
The 1st August, 2013.



FINANCIAL  MEMORANDUM

Clause 4 of the Bill seeks to insert new section 3AA, so as to reconstitute the
Medical Council of India within a period of one hundred and eighty days. The proviso
to section 3AA provides that the Board of Governors (BOG) shall continue to exercise
the powers and perform the functions of the Council till the new Council is
reconstituted or for such period not exceeding one hundred and eighty days,
whichever is earlier. The proposed amendment would automatically increase the term
of the office of the Board of Governors (BOG) up to the 10th November, 2013.  The
Chairperson and other members, other than ex-officio members, of the Board of
Governors shall be entitled to such sitting fee and other allowances as may be
determined by the Central Government. It is expected that such expenditure on sitting
fee and travelling and other allowances would be minimal and will be met from the
funds of the Medical Council of India. Further, as expenditure would depend on the
number of meetings of the Board of Governors during the current financial year, i.e.,
2013-14 recurring or non-recurring expenditure cannot be anticipated at this stage.

8



MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION

Sub-clause (2) of clause 12 of the Bill empowers the Central Government to
make rules for carrying out the provisions of the proposed legislation on matters
relating to—(a) the manner of election of the Council under sub-section (1) of
section 4; (b) such other functions of the Council under clause (h)   of sub-section (2)
of section 9A as may be laid down by the Central Government; (c) the conditions and
payment of fees for filing of an appeal before the Central Government under sub-
section (2) of section 24; (d) any other matter which is required to be, or may be,
provided by rules or in respect of which provision is to be made  by rules.

2. The rules to be made under the proposed legislation shall be required to be
laid before the Parliament.

3. The matters in respect of which rules may be made are matters of procedure
and administrative detail and it is not practicable to provide for them in the Bill itself.

4. The delegation of legislative power is, therefore, of a normal character.

9



Memorandum explaining the Modifications contained in the Bill to replace the
Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Ordinance, 2013.

—————

The Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Bill, 2013, which seeks to repeal and
replace the Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Ordinance, 2013, proposes to make
the following modifications apart from modifications of consequential or drafting
nature in the provisions contained in the said Ordinance, namely:—

(i) The words “in such manner as may be provided by the rules made by
the Central Government” have been dropped from the proposed proviso to
clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 3 of the Indian Medical Council Act,
1956.

(ii) A new sub-clause has been inserted after clause 8(b) to omit sub-
section (4B) of section 13 of the Indian Medical Council Act, 1956.

10



ANNEXURE

EXTRACTS FROM THE INDIAN MEDICAL COUNCIL ACT, 1956
(102 OF 1956)

An Act to provide for the reconstitution for the Medical Council of India, and
the maintenance of a Medical Register for India and for matters connected therewith.

* * * * *

3. (1) The Central Government shall cause to be constituted a Council consisting
of the following members, namely:—

* * * * *

(d) Seven members to be elected from amongst themselves by persons
enrolled or any of the State Medical Registers who possess the medical
qualifications included in Part I of the Third Schedule;

* * * * *

4.  (1) An election under clause (b), clause (c) or clause (d) of sub-section (1) of
section 3 shall be conducted by the Central Government in accordance with such
rules as may be made by it in this behalf, and any rules so made may provide that
pending the preparation of the Indian Medical Register in accordance with the
provisions of this Act, the members referred to in clause (d) of sub-section (1) of
section 3 may be nominated by the Central Government instead of being elected as
provided therein.

* * * * *

7.  (1) The President or Vice-President of the Council shall hold office for a term
not exceeding five years and not extending beyond the expiry of his term as member
of the Council.

(2) Subject to the provisions of this section, a member shall hold office for a
term of five years from the date of his nomination or election or until his successor
shall have been duly nominated or elected, whichever is longer.

* * * * *

(6) Where the said term of five years is about to expire in respect of any member,
a successor may be nominated or elected at any time within three months before the
said term expires but he shall not assume office until the said term has expired.

* * * * *

13.  (1) * * * * *

(2) The medical qualifications granted to a citizen of India—

(a) before the 15th day of August, 1947, by medical institutions in the
territories now forming part of Pakistan, and

(b) before the 1st day of April, 1937, by medical institutions in the territories
now forming part of Burma, which are included in Part I of the Third Schedule
shall also be recognised medical qualifications for the purposes of this Act.

(3) The medical qualifications granted by medical institutions outside India
before such date as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
specify which are included in Part II of the Third Schedule shall also be recognised
medical qualifications for the purposes of this Act, but no person possessing any
such qualification shall be entitled to enrolment or on any State Medical Register
unless he is a citizen of India and has undergone such practical training after obtaining
that qualification as may be required by the rules or regulations in force in the country
granting the qualification, or if he has not undergone any practical training in that
country, he has undergone such practical training as may be prescribed.

* * * * *

Constitution and
Composition of
the Council.

Mode of election.

Recognition of
medical
qualifications
granted by
certain medical
institutions
whose
qualifications are
not included in
the First or
Second Schedule.

Term of office
of President,
Vice-President
and members.

11



12

(4A) A person who is a citizen of India and obtains medical qualification granted
by any medical institution in any country outside India recognised for enrolement as
medical practitioner in that country after such date as may be specified by the Central
Government under sub-section (3), shall not be entitled to be enrolled on any Medical
Register maintained by a State Medical Council or to have his name entered in the
Indian Medical Register unless he qualifies the screening test in India prescribed for
such purpose and such foreign medical qualification after such person qualifies the
said screening test shall be deemed to be the recognised medical qualification for the
purposes of this Act for that person.

(4B) A person who is a citizen of India shall  not, after such date as may be
specified by the Central Government under sub-section (3), be eligible to get admission
to obtain medical qualification granted by any medical institution in any foreign
country without obtaining an eligibility certificate issued to him by the Council and in
case any such person obtains such qualification without obtaining such eligibility
certificate, he shall not be eligible to appear in the screening test referred to in sub-
section (4A):

Provided that an Indian citizen who has acquired the medical qualification from
foreign medical institution or has obtained admission in foreign medical institution
before the commencement of the Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Act, 2001,
shall not be required to obtain eligibility certificate under this sub-section but, if he is
qualified for admission to any medical course for recognised medical qualification in
any medical institution in India, he shall be required to qualify only the screening test
prescribed for enrolement on any State Medical Register or for entering his name in
the Indian Medical Register.

(4C) Nothing contained in sub-sections (4C) and (4B) shall apply to the medical
qualifications referred to in section 14 for the purposes of that section.

* * * * *

14. (1) The Central Government after consultation with the Council may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, direct that medical qualifications granted by medical
institutions in any country outside India in respect of which a scheme of reciprocity
for the recognition of medical qualifications is not in force, shall be recognised medical
qualifications for the purposes of this Act or shall be so only when granted after a
specified date:

Provided that medical practice by persons possessing such qualifications—

* * * * *

(b) shall be limited to the institution to which they are attached for the
time being for the purposes of teaching, research or charitable work; and

* * * * *

21.  (1) The Council shall cause to be maintained, in the prescribed manner a
register of medical practitioners to be known as the Indian Medical Register, which
shall contain the names of the all persons who are for the time being enrolled on any
State Medical Register and who possess any of the recognised medical qualifications.

* * * * *

32. (1) * * * *  *

(2) Every rule made by the Central Government under this Act shall be laid, as
soon as may be after it is made, before each House of Parliament, while it is in session,
for a total period of thirty days which may be comprised in one session or in two or
more successive sessions, and if, before the expirty of the session immediately
following the session or the successive sessions aforesaid, both Houses agree in
making any modification in the rule or both Houses agree that the rule should not be

Power to make
rules.

Special
provision in
certain cases for
recognition of
medical
qualifications
granted by
medical
institutions in
countries with
which there is
no scheme of
reciprocity.

The Indian
Medical Register.



13

made, the rule shall thereafter have effect only in such modified form or be of no
effect, as the case may be; so, however, that any such modification or annulment shall
be without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done under that rule.

33. The Council may, with the previous sanction of the Central Government,
make regulations generally to carry out the purposes of this Act, and, without prejudice
to the generality of this power, such regulations may provide for—

* * * * *

(ma) the modalities for conducting screening tests under
sub-section (4A), and under the proviso to sub-section (4B), and for issuing
eligibility certificate under sub-section (4B)  of section 13;

* * * * *

Power to make
regulations.



RAJYA  SABHA

—————

A

BILL

further to amend the Indian Medical Council Act, 1956.

—————

(Shri Ghulam Nabi Azad, Minister of Health and Family Welfare)

GMGIPMRND—2014LS-(S4)—14.08.2013.



<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /All
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents for quality printing on desktop printers and proofers.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /NA
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles true
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /NA
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


