Bill No. 93-F of 2023

THE REGISTRATION OF BIRTHS AND DEATHS
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023

(As PASSED BY THE HOUSES OF PARLIAMENT—

Lok SABHA ON 1sT AuGusT, 2023

Ra1va SaBHA ON 7TH AuGusT, 2023)

ASSENTED TO ON 11TH AucusT, 2023
Act No. 20 or 2023




Bill No. 93-F of 2023

THE REGISTRATION OF BIRTHS AND DEATHS (AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2023

(As PASSED BY THE HOUSES OF PARLIAMENT)
A
BILL
further to amend the Registration of Births and Deaths Act, 1969.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Registration of Births and Deaths (Amendment) Short title and
Act, 2023. commencement.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, appoint.

18 of 1969. 2. Throughout the Registration of Births and Deaths Act, 1969 (hereinafter referred Construction
to as the principal Act), for the word “Registrar-General”, wherever it occurs, the words of references

« . Y . of certain
Registrar General of India” shall be substituted. expressions by

certain other
expressions.



Amendment
of section 2.

Amendment
of section 3.

Amendment
of section 4.

2

3. In section 2 of the principal Act, in sub-section (/),—

(i) clause (a) shall be re-numbered as clause (ab) thereof, and before clause (ab)
as so re-numbered, the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(@) “Aadhaar number” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in
clause (a) of section 2 of the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of Financial and Other
Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016;

(aa) “adoption” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (2)
of section 2 of the Juvenile Justice (Care and Protection of Children) Act, 2015;’;

(i7) clause (b) shall be re-numbered as clause (ba) thereof, and before clause (ba)
as so re-numbered, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(b) “database” means the organised collection of data, generally stored
and accessed in electronic form from a computer network;’.

4. In section 3 of the principal Act,—

(7) in the marginal heading, for the words “Registrar-General, India”, the words
“Registrar General of India” shall be substituted;

(if) in sub-section (/), for the words “Registrar-General, India”, the words
“Registrar General of India” shall be substituted;

(ii7) in sub-section (3), for the words “and submit”, the words “and the database
of registered births and deaths and submit” shall be substituted;

(iv) after sub-section (3), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) The Registrar General of India shall maintain the database of
registered births and deaths at the National level and it shall be obligatory upon
the Chief Registrars and the Registrars to share the data of registered births and
deaths to such database.

(5) Subject to the proviso to sub-section (/) of section 17 and with the
prior approval of the Central Government, the database of registered births and
deaths maintained under sub-section (4) may, on request, be made available to
the authorities dealing with the preparation or maintenance of database relating
to—

(a) population register;

(b) electoral rolls;

(¢) Aadhaar number;

(d) ration card,

(e) passport;

(f) driving licence;

(g) property registration; and

(h) such other databases at the National level as may be notified,

and the authority shall inform the action taken, within such period as may be
notified from time to time, to the Central Government:

Provided that the preparation or maintenance of database relating to
electoral rolls in clause (b) shall be without prejudice to the provisions of the
Representation of the People Act, 1950.”.

5. In section 4 of the principal Act, after sub-section (4), the following sub-sections

shall be inserted, namely:—

“(5) The Chief Registrar shall take steps to register births or deaths and maintain
a unified database of registered births and deaths at the State level by using the
portal as approved by the Registrar General of India and it shall be obligatory upon
the Registrars to share the data of registered births and deaths to such database.

18 of 2016.

2 of 2016.

43 of 1950.



43 of 1950.

53 of 2005.

3 of 1897.

2 of 2016.

3

(6) Subject to the proviso to sub-section (/) of section 17 and with the prior
approval of the State Government, the database of registered births and deaths
maintained under sub-section (5) at the State level may, on request, be made available
to the authority dealing with other databases at the State level and the authority shall
inform action taken, within such period as may be notified from time to time, to the
State Government:

Provided that the preparation or maintenance of database relating to electoral
rolls shall be without prejudice to the provisions of the Representation of the People
Act, 1950.”.

6. In section 7 of the principal Act,—
(i) in sub-section (2),—

(a) after the words “enter in the register maintained”, the words
“, electronically or otherwise,” shall be inserted;

(D) after the word and figure “section 9”, the words “in respect of births
and deaths which has taken place in his jurisdiction” shall be inserted;

(i7) in sub-section (5),—

(a) for the words “appoint Sub-Registrars and”, the words “appoint
Sub-Registrars and, in the event of any disaster or epidemic, appoint Special
Sub-Registrars” shall be substituted;

(D) the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:—
‘Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section, the expressions,—

(7) “disaster” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in
clause (d) of section 2 of the Disaster Management Act, 2005;

(if) “epidemic” means the epidemic referred to in the Epidemic
Diseases Act, 1897.".

7. In section 8 of the principal Act, in sub-section (/),—
(i) in the opening portion,—

(a) for the words “orally or in writing”, the words “orally or in writing
with signature” shall be substituted;

(D) after the words “several particulars”, the words “including the Aadhaar
number of parents and the informant, if available, in case of birth,” shall be
inserted;

(i7) in clause (a), the word “male” shall be omitted;
(iif) after clause (a), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—
“(aa) in respect of non-institutional adoption, the adoptive parents;

(ab) in respect of birth of a child to a single parent or unwed mother from
her womb, the parent;

(ac) in respect of birth of a child through surrogacy, the biological parent;”;
(iv) after clause (d), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(da) in respect of a child who is taken on adoption from the Specialised
Adoption Agency, the person in-charge of the Specialised Adoption Agency.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause, the expression “Specialised
Adoption Agency” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (57)
of section 2 of the Juvenile Justice (Care and Protection of Children) Act, 2015;

Amendment
of section 7.

Amendment
of section 8.



Amendment
of section 10.

Amendment
of section 11.

Substitution
of new

section for
section 12.

Certificate of
registration
of births or
deaths.

Amendment
of section 13.

4

(db) in respect of an orphan or abandoned child or surrendered child in
any child care institution, the person in-charge or caretaker of the child care
institution.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause, the expressions
“abandoned child” or “child care institution” or “orphan” or “surrendered
child” shall have the same meanings as respectively assigned to them in
clauses (1), (21), (42) and (60) of section 2 of the Juvenile Justice (Care and
Protection of Children) Act, 2015;

(dc) in respect of birth of a child through surrogacy in a surrogacy clinic,
the person in-charge of the surrogacy clinic.

Explanation—For the purposes of this clause, the expressions
“surrogacy” and “surrogacy clinic” shall have the same meanings as
respectively assigned to them in clauses (zd) and (ze) of sub-section (/) of
section 2 of the Surrogacy (Regulation) Act, 2021;’.

8. In section 10 of the principal Act, for sub-sections (2) and (3), the following

sub-sections shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2) Where death occurs in any medical institution providing specialised
treatment or general treatment, every such institution, irrespective of ownership,
shall, free of charge, provide a certificate of the cause of death, including the history
of illness, if any, signed by the medical practitioner who attended that person during
his recent illness to the Registrar in such form as may be prescribed and provide a
copy of such certificate to the nearest relative.

(3) In the event of death of any person occurring in any place other than
medical institution, and such person was, during his recent illness, attended to by a
medical practitioner, such medical practitioner shall, after the death of that person,
free of charge, forthwith issue, a certificate of the cause of death, including the
history of illness, if any, to the person required under this Act to give information
concerning the death in such form as may be prescribed, and the person, on receipt of
the certificate, shall deliver the same to the Registrar at the time of giving information of
the death as required under this Act.”.

9. In section 11 of the principal Act, for the words “place of abode, and, if he cannot

write”, the words “place of abode and put his signature thereto, and, if he cannot write”
shall be substituted.

10. For section 12 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted,

namely:—

“12. The Registrar shall, as soon as the registration of a birth or death has been
completed, but not later than seven days, give, free of charge, electronically or
otherwise under his signature, to the person who gives information under section 8 or
section 9, a certificate extracted from the register relating to such birth or death in
such form and manner as may be prescribed.”.

11. In section 13 of the principal Act, for sub-sections (2) and (3), the following

sub-sections shall be substituted, namely:—

‘(2) Any birth or death of which delayed information is given to the Registrar
after thirty days but within one year of its occurrence, shall be registered only with
the written permission of the District Registrar or such other authority, on payment of
such fee and on production of self-attested document in such form and manner as
may be prescribed.

(3) Any birth or death of which delayed information is given to the Registrar
after one year of its occurrence, shall be registered only on an order made by a

2 of 2016.

47 of 2021.



2 of 1974.

5

District Magistrate or Sub-Divisional Magistrate or by an Executive Magistrate
authorised by the District Magistrate, having jurisdiction over the area where the
birth or death has taken place, after verifying the correctness of the birth or death and
on payment of such fee as may be prescribed.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section, the expression “Executive
Magistrate” means the Executive Magistrate appointed under sub-section (/) of
section 20 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973.°.

12. In section 16 of the principal Act, in sub-section (/), after the words “register of
births and deaths”, the words *, electronically or otherwise,” shall be inserted.

13. In section 17 of the principal Act,—

(7) in sub-section (/), for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(b) obtain, electronically or otherwise, a certificate of birth or death from
such register and issued in such form and manner as may be prescribed:

Provided that no certificate relating to any death, issued to any person, shall disclose
the particulars regarding the cause of death as entered in the register.”;

(if) in sub-section (2), for the word “extracts” occurring at both the places, the
word “certificates” shall be substituted;

(iii) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other law for the time
being in force, the certificate referred to in sub-section (2) or section 12, shall be
used to prove the date and place of birth of a person who is born on or after the
date of commencement of the Registration of Births and Deaths (Amendment)
Act, 2023, for the purposes of—

(a) admission to an educational institution;
(b) issuance of a driving licence;

(c) preparation of a voter list;

(d) registration of a marriage;

(e) appointment to a post in the Central Government or State
Government or a local body or public sector undertaking or in any
statutory or autonomous body under the Central Government or State
Government;

(f) issuance of a passport;
(g) issuance of an Aadhaar number; and

(h) any other purpose as may be determined by the Central
Government.”.

14. In section 18 of the principal Act, for the words “by the District Registrar”, the
words “in general or special order by the Chief Registrar” shall be substituted.

15. In section 23 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (/),—

(7) in the opening portion, for the words “Any person”, the words, brackets,
figure and letter “Any person, except the person specified in sub-section (/A),”
shall be substituted;

(if) in clause (c), after the words “thumb mark”, the words “or signature,
as the case may be,” shall be inserted;

Amendment
of section 16.

Amendment
of section 17.

Amendment
of section 18.

Amendment
of section 23.



6

(iii) in the long line, for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “two hundred
and fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

(D) after sub-section (7), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1A) Whoever, being a person specified in clauses (b), (¢), (d), (da), (db),
(dc) and (e) of sub-section (/) of section 8,—

(a) fails without reasonable cause to give any information which it
is his duty to give; or

(b) gives or causes to be given, for the purpose of being inserted in
any register of births and deaths, any information which he knows or
believes to be false regarding any of the particulars required to be known
and registered; or

(c) refuses to write his name, description and place of abode or to
put his thumb mark or signature in the register as required under section 11,

shall be punishable with fine which may extend to one thousand rupees in
respect of each birth or death.”;

(¢) in sub-section (2),—

(7) after the words “in his jurisdiction”, the words and figures “or to give
a certificate to the informant under section 12” shall be inserted;

(if) for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”
shall be substituted;

(d) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) Any person who neglects or refuses to provide or issue a certificate
as required under sub-section (2) or sub-section (3) of section 10 or any person
neglects or refuses to deliver such certificate to the Registrar, shall be punishable
with fine which may extend to fifty rupees.”;

(e) in sub-section (4),—

(i) for the words “Any Person”, the words, brackets, figure and letter
“Any person except the person specified in sub-section (/A)” shall be
substituted;

(i) for the words “ten rupees”, the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”
shall be substituted;

(f) after sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4A) Any person specified in sub-section (/A), who, without reasonable
cause, contravenes any provision of this Act for the contravention of which no
penalty is provided for in this section, shall be punishable with fine which may
extend to one thousand rupees in respect of each birth or death.”;

(g) in sub-section (5), for the words and figures “Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1898, the words and figures “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 shall be
substituted.

Amendment 16. In section 24 of the principal Act, in sub-section (7), for the portion beginning
of section 24.  with the words “proceedings under this Act” and ending with the words “fifty rupees”, the
following shall be substituted, namely:—

“proceedings under this Act,—

(a) accept from the person, except the person specified in sub-section (/A)
of section 23, who has committed or is reasonably suspected of having
committed an offence under this Act, by way of composition of such offence a
sum of money not exceeding two hundred and fifty rupees;

5 of 1898.
2 of 1974.



7

(b) accept from the person specified in sub-section (/A) of section 23,
who has committed or is reasonably suspected of having committed an offence
under this Act, by way of composition of such offence a sum of money not
exceeding one thousand rupees in respect of each birth or death.”.

17. After section 25 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“25A. (1) Any person aggrieved by any action or order of,—
(i) the Registrar, may prefer an appeal to the District Registrar; or

(if) the District Registrar, may prefer an appeal to the Chief Registrar,

within a period of thirty days from the date of such action or receipt of such order, as
the case may be, in such form and manner as may be prescribed.

(2) The District Registrar or the Chief Registrar, as the case may be, shall decide
the appeal referred to in sub-section (/) within a period of ninety days from the date
of preferring of such appeal.”.

18. In section 30 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),—
(i) for clauses (d), (e) and (f), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely:—

“(d) the form of certificate of the cause of death under sub-sections (2)
and (3) of section 10;

(e) the form and manner in which the certificate of birth or death may be
given under section 12;

(f) the authority which may grant permission for registration of a birth or
death and the form and manner of production of self-attested document under
sub-section (2) of section 13;”;

(i) after clause (g), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ga) the form and manner in which the certificate of birth or death may be
obtained under clause (b) of sub-section (/) of section 17;

(gb) the form and manner of preferring an appeal under sub-section (/) of
section 25A;;

(iti) in clause (i), for the word “extracts”, the word “certificates” shall be
substituted.

Insertion of new
section 25A.

Appeal.

Amendment
of section 30.



A
BILL

further to amend the Registration of Births and Deaths Act, 1969.

(As passed by the Houses of Parliament)

MGIPMRND—304RS(S3)—16-08-2023.




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /All
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /CMYK
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (None)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents for quality printing on desktop printers and proofers.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /NA
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles true
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /NA
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


